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MILL CITY PLANNING COMMISSION 
Meeting of May 16, 2017  

 
 
Planning Commission members present: Chair Ann Carey, Dennis Chamberlin, Marge Henning, David 
Leach, Woody Koenig, Grant Peterson and Frances Villwock.    
 
Staff in attendance: None.     
City Council Representatives:  None.  
Agency Representatives:  None. 
Citizens present: Spring Aerni.   
 
The meeting was called to order at 6:30 p.m.  Chair Ann Carey led the pledge of allegiance.  
 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES:  
 
The April 24, 2017 minutes were reviewed by Planning Commission.   Dave Leach moved, seconded 
by Denny Chamberlin, to approve the minutes of April 24, 2017 as presented.  The motion carried 
unanimously (7:0). 
 
PUBLIC COMMENT:   None. 
 
PUBLIC HEARINGS:     
 
File No. 2016-13  Proposed Modifications to Variance Approval 
Proposal: Variance to Section 17.16.060 Setbacks    
Applicant: Spring Aerni 
Location: 710 SE 3rd Avenue, Mill City 
  Map 9S3E32BB Tax Lot 5200 
 
Chair Ann Carey opened the public hearing at 6:35 p.m.  Mrs. Carey read the opening statement.  
Mrs. Carey asked Planning Commissioners if they wished to declare any conflict of interest, ex 
parte contact or bias related to the proposal.  There were no declarations.  All members affirmed 
they could consider the application in an impartial manner.    
 
Mrs. Carey stated that Spring Aerni is requesting a modification to her existing setback variance to 
approve additional structures on the property to meet the same setback criteria which was approved 
with the original hearing. 
 
Mrs. Carey stated that since Grant Peterson was not involved in the original application he can 
participate in the discussion but should refrain from voting. 
 
Applicant’s Presentation:  Spring Aerni, applicant stated that after her initial approval she found that another 
structure was in need of removal and wished to have the same setback as was granted before with the 
replacement structure that will go up. 
 
It was asked what the setback for the new structure will be.  Ms. Aerni said it will be a zero setback.  The 
home was built very close to the property line which does not allow for any attachments to meet the setback 
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requirements. 
 
Staff Report: Mrs. Carey read from the staff report, stating that this is a non-conforming use because the 
setback requirement is 15 feet.  The request for the variance will be an amendment to the existing 
variance approval to a zero lot line setback. 
Ms. Aerni was asked about her previous request for a street vacation.  Ms. Aerni said that it was going 
to be too expensive for them so they withdrew the request.  Mrs. Carey said that the Council is now 
handling the street issue. 
Proponents:   No citizens testified. 
Opponents:   No citizens testified. 
General Testimony/Agency Comments:  No citizens testified. 
Questions of Clarification from the Planning Commission and Staff:  None. 
Applicant’s Summary and Rebuttal:   None. 
 
Staff Summary:  None. 
Close of the Hearing:  Chair Ann Carey closed the public hearing at 6:50 p.m.   
Deliberation and Decision:   

File 2016-13 Aerni–Variance Amendment:  Commissioner Frances Villwock moved, seconded 
by Commissioner Woody Koenig, to a modification to the variance approval for Spring Aerni 
at 710 SE Third Avenue, File No. 2016-13 to allow a garage, main home, deck and awning to 
have a zero lot line setback on SE 3rd Avenue. (Approved 6:0). 

The decision will be forwarded to the City Council for ratification of the approval at the next regularly 
scheduled city council meeting on May 23, 2017.   The City Council may elect to ratify the Planning 
Commission decision or call the issue up for a public hearing.    If the City Council ratifies the Planning 
Commission decision, the decision will be final unless it is appealed to the City Council within 15 days 
of the date the Notice of Decision is issued by the City. 

  
OLD BUSINESS:   None. 

NEW BUSINESS:  None. 

OTHER BUSINESS: 
 
Notice of Decision – Baughman/Lucas Comp Plan Amendment-Zoning Change:  Mrs. Carey said that 
the Notice of Decision for the Baughman/Lucas Comp Plan Amendment-Zoning Change was provided 
in the Planning Commission boxes. 
 
Lot Line Adjustment Application – Scott Baughman:  Mrs. Carey said that a notice of decision for a Lot 
Line Adjustment application for Scott Baughman was provided to the Planning Commission for review.  
The Planning Commission can affirm, deny or modify the staff decision.  Mr. Carey explained that the 
applicant has requested that two property lines be modified; the western property line on tax lot 1002 
will be brought west 20 feet and the southern property line of tax lot 900 will be brought south to the 
right-of-way line. 
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It was asked for clarification of what the “meander line” is.  Discussion ensued as to it possibly being 
the water line.  This will be asked of Mr. Kinney for an explanation at the next meeting. 
 
Grant Peterson asked why the staff does not handle variances instead of the Planning Commission.  This 
will be asked of Mr. Kinney. 
 
Mrs. Villwock asked if there is anything further that needs to be done on the lot line adjustment 
application.  Mrs. Carey said that there is not.  The Planning Commission should not call for a hearing 
unless there is a valid reason to do so.  Mrs. Villwock said that she would like clarification on what this 
process should be.  Mrs. Carey will have Mr. Kinney address this at the next meeting. 
 
BUSINESS FROM THE PLANNING COMMISSION:  None. 
 
The next meeting of the Planning Commission will be June 20, 2017 at 6:30 p.m. 
The meeting was adjourned at 6:59 p.m. 
  
Prepared by: 
 
 
Stacie Cook, MMC, City Recorder/Planning Secretary  
 
Minutes approved by the Planning Commission on the 21st day of June, 2017. 
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John Newberg, Newberg Surveying, has prepared maps and legal descriptions. The new ordinances 
were submitted to the Oregon DOR cartography staff for preliminary approval.  The Council held a 
first reading on June 13th and is scheduled for final adoption on June 27, 2017 (subject to DOR 
issuance of a letter of preliminary approval). 
 
Once the annexation ordinances are adopted, the City will submit them to Linn County Planning, 
Linn County GIS, Oregon Department of Revenue, the Oregon Secretary of State’s office, DLCD 
and private utilities. 

 Action Requested:   None, information only. 

 
b. Marion County Natural Hazards Mitigation Plan – Mill City Addendum. 

 
At the February 21, 2017 Kathleen Silva, Marion County Emergency Management Coordinator, did 
a brief presentation on Marion County’s proposal to update the county-wide natural hazards 
mitigation plan.    At that meeting she indicated Marion County will provide the City with an updated 
copy of the Mill City Addendum to the county-wide hazards mitigation plan. 
 
I contacted Kathleen via email to get more information on the status of the project and to invite her 
to a future planning commission meeting.   

She responded the Marion County Emergency Management staff and its consultant completed the 
update in May 2017.  FEMA has completed a review of the plan and has tentatively approved it.   
Marion County Emergency Management has requested the City Council adopt a resolution 
concurring with the Marion County Natural Hazards Mitigation Plan and the City of Mill City annex.  

A copy of the Mill City Addenda is included in the PC Packet. 

     Action Requested:   Discussion & invite Kathleen Silva to attend a future meeting.   

 
c.   PC Question – Variance Decision Procedures. 

 
Grant Peterson asked about the city’s variance procedures and why the Planning Commission 
considered variances versus them being a staff administrative review. 
 
Variances may be granted to either the subdivision code (parcel sizes and dimensions) or to the zoning 
code (setbacks, building height, lot size, development standards, public works standards).   The City 
Council has delegated responsibility to the Planning Commission to review variances because they 
involve some discretion and interpretation of the intent of the zoning and subdivision codes. 
 

  Section 17.52.010 Purpose of Variances  

The planning commission may authorize variances from the requirements of this title, 
where it can be shown that owing to special and unusual circumstances related to a 
specific lot, strict application of the ordinance would cause an undue or unnecessary 
hardship. No variance shall be created to allow the use of property for a purpose not 
authorized within the zone in which the proposed use would be located.  

The City Council reviews variance decisions of the Planning Commission.  If the City Council has 
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questions or concerns with the Planning Commission’s decision, it may place the PC decision in 
abeyance and then hold a public hearing to consider the issue and make a final decision.  If the council 
has no concerns, the Planning Commission decision is final. 
 
 Action Requested:   None, information only. 
 

d. PC Question – What is a meander line? 
 

The course of streams and rivers can change over time.  The “meander line” is the historic tracking 
of the change in course of the creek or stream. 
 

e.   Oregon Connections Academy – Project Completion. 
 

ODOT and City approval for the Oregon Connections Academy building expansion required them to 
reconstruct/pave the east driveway approach and the curb line.  This work was completed earlier this 
Spring.  The project is complete. 

 
f.  Subway – Project Completion. 

 
ODOT and City approval for the Subway project required them to modify and reconstruct the 
driveway approaches and sidewalk along the Hwy 22 frontage before July 1, 2017.  This work has 
not been completed.  ODOT is following up with the applicant to get the required permit and 
approaches completed. The project is complete and file closed. 
 

g. Blaylock Mini-Storage – Project Completion. 
 

Mr. Blaylock’s project engineer has submitted a letter to the City stating that the drainage 
improvements on site were completed as designed.    The project is complete and file closed. 
 
The Planning Commission and City Council have modified the City’s zoning code to require future 
development of commercial buildings along the Hwy 22 corridor to install paved parking with a new 
building. 
 
 

8. New Business 
 

a.  West Broadway Street Improvements (1st to 4th) – Linn County Roads Design 
 

In 2016 the City Council asked the Planning Commission to assist with the review of any street and 
streetscape design for West Broadway Street improvements. 
 
County Engineer Chuck Knoll, Linn County Roads Department, has notified the City that they will 
begin survey work, preliminary design and cost estimating for the project.   This phase will be 
completed by mid-September.    No date has been set for construction yet, but it is likely to occur in 
summer 2019, if not before. 
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  Date
Start 
Time

End 
Time Total Admin

FY 2018 
Budget

SOB       
RR Bridge

Planning 
General

2016‐13 
Aerni VAR

2017‐02 
UGB 

Amendmt
Zoning Code 
Amendmts No   Charge  Total

 Work Activities Miles

Land Use Applications

3/31/2017 1:00 3:30 2.50         2.50          2.50            Prepare March 21, 2017 PC minutes

4/2/2017 2:00 2:45 0.75         0.75            0.75            Prepare March 21, 2017 PC minutes; Email DRAFT to Ann Carey for review

4/2/2017 3:00 4:00 1.00         1.00          1.00            Review Budget Narratives (make corrections); Budget Message Outline

4/3/2017 3:45 5:00 1.25         0.75          0.50           1.25            Mtg w/ Dorothy Keasey re: OPRD RTF environmental review forms

4/3/2017 6:00 8:45 2.75         2.75          2.75            Budget Committee Mtg #1 38

4/4/2017 9:30 11:00 1.50         1.50          1.50            
Review Agenda for 4-10-2017 mtg; Revise Wages spreadsheet to reallocate the PW 
Supervisor personnel expenses; Insert Budget Committee column for funds 
discussed on 4-03-2017.

4/4/2017 12:30 1:45 1.25         1.00          0.25           1.25            Transfer Resolution for FY 2016-2017

4/4/2017 1:45 3:15 1.25         1.00          0.25           1.25            Supplemental Budget Resolution for FY 2016-2017

4/5/2017 1:00 1:05 0.10         0.10          0.10            Respond to fence question from Kim Johnson, Email map of site - clear vision area.

4/5/2017 3:30 5:00 1.50         0.75          0.75           1.50            Environmental Review form

4/6/2017 9:00 10:30 1.25         0.75          0.50           1.25            Environmental Review forms - compile & email to Roel & Dorothy for edits.

4/6/2017 11:30 1:30 1.75         1.75          1.75            Budget Handouts for April 10, 2017 meeting

4/6/2017 7:15 9:15 2.00         2.00           2.00            Budget:  LB-1 Reconciliation for FY 15-16, 16-17 and 17-18

4/7/2017 9:15 9:45 0.50         0.50          0.50            Edits per Roel & Dorothy; Email revised docs to Dorothy, Roel & Lynda

4/8/2017 11:45 4:00 4.00         4.00            4.00            2017-02  Findings - UGB Alternative sites analysis and maps

4/9/2017 12:30 3:00 2.50         2.50            2.50            2017-02 Findings - UGB Alernative sites analysis

4/10/2017 8:45 4:00 6.50         4.00            2.50           6.50            2017-02 Findings - UGB Alernative sites analysis

4/10/2017 6:15 8:45 2.50         2.50          2.50            2nd Budget Committee Meeting 38

4/11/2017 9:30 10:45 1.00         1.00          1.00            Compile Budget Docs and Send to Stacie Cook.  Ask to forward to the Auditor for 
review.

4/11/2017 11:30 1:30 2.00         2.00            2.00            2017-02 Findings - UGB Alernative sites analysis

4/12/2017 9:30 9:40 0.20         0.20            0.20            Call with Chair Ann Carey to discuss PC meeting and decision process; Ask her to 
poll PC members for a special meeting to deliberate on the proposal.

4/12/2017 10:00 3:45 5.75         5.75            5.75            2017-02 Findings - Prepare and email findings and PC Packet to City

4/13/2017 9:30 10:45 1.00         0.75          0.25           1.00            Final edit and submittal of Environmental Review forms to State Agencies; cc: to 
Anita Leach and Stacie Cook.

4/13/2017 12:30 2:30 2.00         1.00          1.00           2.00            Marion County/ODOT meeting re: RR Bridge - funding options w/ ODOT (TIGER 
GRANT or CONNECT OREGON). 36

4/14/2017 10:00 10:15 0.25         0.25          0.25            2016-09  - Ordinance 392 - Notice of Adoption filed w/ DLCD PAPA online.

4/14/2017 12:00 12:15 0.25          0.25           0.25            2008-09 - Ordinance 355 - Cree.  Filed withdrawal notice to DLCD - PAPA online 
to close out the file.

4/14/2017 12:30 4:00 3.50         3.00            0.50           3.50            2017-02   Agency Notice (Email); Annexation Findings; City Council Public Hearing
Notice (Canyon Weekly); City Council Public Hearing Notice (Property Owners);

4/17/2017 9:00 9:45 0.75         0.50          0.25            0.75            DRAFT PC Minutes: Emails w/ Brandon Reich, MC Planning and Robert 
Wheeldon, Linn County Planning

4/18/2017 8:45 9:45 1.00         1.00            1.00            2017-02  TOC for PC Staff Report

4/18/2017 5:30 8:20 2.75         0.75          2.00            2.75            2017-02  Prepare Maps for Public Hearing Presentation - Alt Sites Analysis;   
Continued Public Hearing; PC Meeting 38
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End 
Time Total Admin

FY 2018 
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SOB       
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Planning 
General

2016‐13 
Aerni VAR

2017‐02 
UGB 

Amendmt
Zoning Code 
Amendmts No   Charge  Total

 Work Activities Miles

Land Use Applications

4/19/2017 10:00 12:00 2.00         1.00          1.00           2.00            SOB Grants Committee Meting at City Hall; OPRD Grant Application 38

4/19/2017 2:00 3:00 1.00         1.00          1.00            LB-1 Review and Email Stacie Cook corrected totals for LB-1.

4/19/2017 3:05 3:15 0.15         0.15            0.15            Notice of Special Meeting to Kim Johnson/Stacie for posting.

4/20/2017 10:45 1:15 2.50         1.50          1.00           2.50            SOB Meeting w/ Bob Hirte, Hamilton Construction re: preliminary cost estimate for 
bridge restoration; 38

4/20/2017 1:45 3:45 2.00         1.00            1.00           2.00            2017-02  Linn County Planning - Meeting w/ Robert Wheeldon & Alyssa Boles re: 
Baughman-Lucas Application & County Review process 56

4/21/2017 10:00 10:15 0.25         0.25          0.25            OPRD Grant App - Land Use Compatibility Statement

4/21/2017 1:30 1:40 0.20         0.20          0.20            
2016-13  Aerni - Variance Modification, Email to Stacie to respond to questions.  
Agree that proposal can modify the existing variance, but requires a hearing at the 
PC level due to substantive change.

4/21/2017 1:40 2:00 0.30         0.30            0.30            2017-02  Baughman-Lucas.  Prep 4-24-2017 agenda; Email to Ann Carey re: 
participation by Marge Henning; Email to Stacie & Jeff Tross w/ AGENDA

4/21/2017 2:00 3:15 1.25         1.25            1.25            2017-02:  PC Staff Report

4/21/2017 4:00 5:00 1.00         1.00            1.00            2017-02:  PC Staff Report

4/22/2017 10:30 3:30 4.00         4.00            4.00            
2017-02:  PC Packet including Recommendation Memo; UGB Sites Analysis 
Revision, etc. Emailed to PC members; Stacie Cook; Scott Baughman and Jeff 
Tross.

4/23/2017 10:50 2:45 4.00         4.00          4.00            Budget:  Compile Budget Narrative & BC Approved Budget for CC hearing

4/23/2017 5:00 7:00 2.00         1.50          0.50           2.00            Budget:  Compile Budget Narrative & BC Approved Budget for CC hearing

4/24/2017 9:00 11:00 2.00         2.00          2.00            Budget:  Compile Budget Narrative & BC Approved Budget for CC hearing; Email 
Word & .pdf docs to Stacie.

4/24/2017 11:00 11:30 0.35         0.35          0.35            Budget:  Edit Resolution 807 - Budget Adoption for FY 2017-2018

4/24/2017 11:20 11:25 0.10         0.10            0.10            2017-02:  Phone call w/ Ann Carey re: staff report, motions and decision process for 
Special PC meeting

4/24/2017 4:00 4:10 0.20         0.20          0.20            City Hall - LLA Application and potential for future partition & zone change by 
Scott Baughman on SE Fairview Street.

4/24/2017 4:15 5:00 0.75         0.75            0.75            2017-02:   Minutes - April 18, 2017 PC meeting

4/24/2017 5:15 6:10 0.85         0.10          0.75            0.85            2017-02:   Minutes - April 24, 2017 PC Meeting - Prep DRAFT minutes; Prepare 
annexation area map for Ord 342

4/24/2017 6:30 7:30 1.00         1.00            1.00            2017-02:  Special PC Meeting - Deliberations and Decision 38

4/25/2017 9:45 10:05 0.35         0.35            0.35            
2017-02:   Email adopted PC minutes for April 18, 2017 PC meeting to Stacie; 
Email to Stacie Cook, Scott Baughman and Jeff Tross re: PC decision and CC public
hearing notice; 

4/25/2017 10:10 11:15 1.05         1.05            1.05            2017-02:  Prepare DRAFT PC minutes for April 24, 2017 meeting.  Email to Ann 
Carey for review.; Email to Stacie after Ann C reviewed

4/25/2017 1:30 1:45 0.20         0.20          0.20            PC Agenda - June 20, 2017 Meeting
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Start 
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Budget

SOB       
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Planning 
General

2016‐13 
Aerni VAR

2017‐02 
UGB 

Amendmt
Zoning Code 
Amendmts No   Charge  Total

 Work Activities Miles

Land Use Applications

4/26/2017 10:00 12:00 2.00         1.00          1.00           2.00            SOB Grants Committee Meting at City Hall; OPRD Grant Application 38

4/28/2017 2:00 3:15 1.25         1.25            1.25            Prep City Council Staff Report - Incorporate all PC Corrections; Update Mill City 
UGB Alternative Sites Analysis for Council packet;

-              

             -    

    86.35            -        21.35        8.25        4.90              -          0.20        38.40              -         13.25        86.35     358 

       Hours  Rate  Total 

73.10 70 5,117.00       
358                0.55 196.90        

5,313.90     
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  Date
Start 
Time

End 
Time Total Admin

FY 2018 
Budget

SOB                      
RR Bridge

Planning 
General

Erdman           
Pre-App

2016-13 
Aerni VAR

2017-02 
UGB 

Amendmt

2017-03 
Baughman 

LLA
No   

Charge  Total
 Work Activities Miles

4/30/2017 11:15 2:45 3.50          3.00            0.50         3.50          2017-02   Prepare City Council Report and Exhibits

4/30/2017 2:45 4:00 1.25         1.25          1.25          2016-13 Aerni Variance Amendment Staff Report; Notice of Public Hearing; 
DRAFT Notice of Decision; Email docs to Stacie Cook

5/1/2017 9:45 10:00 0.25         0.25          0.25          2016-13  PC hearing guide for Aerni; Call w/ Ann Carey re: meeting date

5/1/2017 11:15 11:45 0.25         0.25          0.25          Prep PC Packet for May 16, 2017 meeting; Distribute to PC members boxes; 
Email agenda packet to Stacie Cook and Spring Aerni,

5/1/2017 10:00 11:15 1.10         1.10           1.10          Meeting w/ Mike Erdman re: redevleopment of 1st Ave/Wall Street property into 
Brew pub/hotel/retail building. 38

5/1/2017 2:00 5:00 2.50         2.50           2.50          DRAFT Notice of Decision for Baughman Lot Line Adjustment; Email DRAFT 
decision to John Ashley, PE.

5/1/2017 4:00 4:10 0.15         0.15          0.15          2016-13  Send PH Notice to Canyon Weekly; Send PH Notice (Prop Owners) to 
Stacie Cook.

5/3/2017 9:45 10:15 0.50         0.50         0.50          City Hall - SOB Grants Mtg cancelled.

5/3/2017 12:45 1:15 0.50         0.50            0.50          2017-02  DRAFT Notice of City Council Decision for issuance if City approves 
the proposal.

5/4/2017 9:15 10:00 0.75         0.75           0.75          2017-03  Call w/ John Ashley to review LLA requirements and conditions; 
Modify letter of approval; Email to Russ F. and Stacie C for review.

5/4/2017 1:00 3:00 2.00         2.00          2.00          2017-04  Readoption of Ord 342/343 annexation areas.

5/4/2017 4:45 6:15 1.50         1.50          1.50          2017-04  Readoption of Ord 342/343 annexations; Prepare ordinances and maps; 

5/4/2017 6:45 9:15 2.50         2.50          2.50          2017-04  Readoption of Ord 342 / 343 annexation areas.; Prepare ordinances, 
maps, insert Barker (2008) and Lucas legal descriptions (2006). 

5/5/2017 9:05 9:10 0.10         0.10          0.10          2016-13  Respond to Stacie Cook question re: Grant Peterson participation in 
public hearing on the amendment to her variance approval.

5/5/2017 9:30 11:30 2.00         2.00          2.00          2017-04  Ord 342 and Ord 343 Corrective Ordinances

5/5/2017 11:30 2:30 2.50         2.50           2.50          2017-02  Prepare UGB Adjustment and Comp Plan Map Ordinancne

5/5/2017 3:15 4:45 1.50         1.50           1.50          2017-02  Prepare Annexation and Zone Change Ordinance

5/8/2017 10:45 11:45 1.00         0.50          0.50           1.00          2017-02  Linn County GIS and Planning to review mapping for ordinances

5/9/2017 4:00 5:00 1.00         1.00          1.00          Mtg w/ Ann Carey to review Ordinances for 342, 343 and 2017-02 Lucas-
Baughman

5/9/2017 5:30 6:30 0.75         0.75           0.75          Mtg w/ Jeff Tross to review ordinances, legal descriptions needed.

5/9/2017 6:30 9:00 2.50         1.00          1.50           2.50          City Council Public Hearings - Budget and 2017-02 Lucas-Baughman 38

5/11/2017 11:15 11:25 0.20         0.20          0.20          Call w/ Ann Carey; fix Ordinance #1 and #2 with repeal information;

5/11/2017 11:25 12:00 0.60         0.60           0.60          Prepare and Email a Notice of Decision to Rex Lucas, Scott Baughman, Jeff 
Tross, Stacie Cook. Etc.

5/12/2017 9:45 11:45 2.00         1.00          1.00         2.00          
Mtg w/ Danielle Gonzalez, Lynda Harrington, Dorothy Keasey and conference 
call w/ CFM public relations firm re: potential federal TIGER Grant funding for 
the RR Bridge Project 36

5/12/2017 11:45 12:00 0.15         0.15          0.15          Site visit - Rosie's w/ Russ Foltz

5/12/2017 12:15 1:15 1.00          1.00          1.00          Review ORCA compliance with Conditions of Approval for issuance of the 
Certificate of Occupancy;  Email to John Ashley, Stacie and Russ.

5/15/2017 & -
5/17/2017 varied 0.20         0.20           0.20          Phone calls w/ Scott Baughman re: width of easement for storm sewer from SE 

Fairview Street north across the property to N. Santiam River discharge
           -    

    32.25           -          1.00        1.00      10.85          1.10        2.00        10.85          3.45           -         2.00      32.25     112 

Land Use Applications
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David W. Kinney
Community Development Consultant

791 E. Hollister Street, Stayton, OR  97383
Office: 503.769.2020 * Cell: 503.551.0899  * Fax: 503.769.4111

dwkinney@wvi.com

Client: City of Mill City Month: May 2017

  Date
Start 
Time

End 
Time Total Admin

FY 2018 
Budget

SOB                      
RR Bridge

Planning 
General

Erdman           
Pre-App

2016-13 
Aerni VAR

2017-02 
UGB 

Amendmt

2017-03 
Baughman 

LLA
No   

Charge  Total
 Work Activities Miles

Land Use Applications

       Hours  Rate  Total 

30.25 70 2,117.50    
112            0.55 61.60         

2,179.10   

Admin
FY 2018 
Budget

SOB                      
RR Bridge

Planning 
General

Erdman           
Pre-App

2016-13 
Aerni VAR

2017-02 UGB 
Amendmt

2017-03 
Baughman 

LLA
Totals

Hours -             70.00         70.00         759.50       77.00           140.00        759.50         241.50         2,117.50    

Expenses -             19.80         -             20.90           -              20.90           61.60         

Total -             70.00         89.80         759.50       97.90           140.00        780.40         241.50         2,179.10    

mailto:dwkinney@wvi.com


Vendor: David Kinney
Invoice Date: 4/1/2017

Fund Account # Admin
FY 2017-18 

Budget Prep
SOB   Railroad 

Bridge
Planning 
General

Erdman Aerni Variance
2017-02 UGB 

Amendmt
2017-03 

Baughman LLA
Total Account #

General 10-3-3003 Planning - Consultant -                    21.00               759.50             97.90               140.00             780.40             241.50             2,040.30          10-3-3003
Street 11-3-3003 Consulting 7.00                  7.00                  11-3-3003
Water 19-3-3009 Engineer/Consultants 21.00               21.00               19-3-3009
Sewer 31-3-3009 Engineer/Consultants 21.00               21.00               31-3-3009
RR Bridge 13-3-3003 Engineer/Consultants 89.80               89.80               13-3-3003

-                    70.00               89.80               759.50             97.90               140.00             780.40             241.50             2,179.10         

City of Mill City
Accounts Payable 

Allocation by Account #
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